
BID TABULATION

ABBEVILLE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT
400 GREENVILLE ST., ABBEVILLE. SC   29620

PROJECT: MOUNTED CLASSROOM PROJECTORS AT TWO SCHOOLS

BIDDER BASE BASE ALTERNATE BIDS   OPTIONAL
BID #1 BID #2 EXTENDED WARRANTY   ELECTRICAL

CTES WWES A 1 - CTES A 1 - WWES A 2 A 3 A 4 A 5 - CTES A 5 - WWES

 Advanced Video no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Multi Media Services $43,438.00 $21,719.00 $2,500.00 $1,500.00 $214.00 $2,171.90 listed no bid no bid

Cynergi Systems, LLC $70,380.82 $33,881.81 $14,076.16 $6,776.36 $345.63 $3,519.41 listed no bid no bid

Camcor $69,588.00 $34,994.00 $8,014.00 $4,007.00 $146.00 $4,623.00 listed no bid no bid

Ronco Specialized Systems no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Troxell Communications $44,346.20 $22,173.10 $1,650.00 $825.00 $285.00  unable to determine listed no bid no bid

Bannister Music Center no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Network Controls & Electric $66,447.00 $33,223.50 $2,400.00 $1,200.00 $196.88 $3,322.35 listed $4,180.00 $2,090.00

One Source Building Tech $99,878.00 $50,010.00 $9,030.00 $4,525.00 $406.00 $4,995.00 listed no bid no bid

Security Unlimited no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

 CSI Outfitters no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Telcom Inc. $45,125.50 $22,562.75 $2,000.00 $1,000.00 $117.50 $2,528.78 listed $2,500.00 $1,250.00

 Matrix Media Partners $59,280.00 $29,640.00 $3,000.00 $1,500.00 $183.00 $2,964.00 listed no bid no bid
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WITNESS ________________________________

WITNESS ________________________________
ABBEVILLE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT


